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RANDALL CSUHTY VOLUNTHER TIRE DfrPARTMENT
FIRE PRO?E$TIO}I SONTHACT

lT l$ ilEREBy ASnEED b:r and between Randall county, Texas, {here*fter, Randall

Countyi ** Village of P*li*ades, Department of Public $afia$, Volunteer Fire

n*e*rim*nt (heraaifier, the Fira Daparttnant) t{rorpft t!3 B-a$ry: -duly authorieed

officors and pursuant to Texas Local Govemment Code sectbn SS2.001 that:

Ttre Fire Depafiment shalt provide the residents of Rsndall County with
fire-fighting equipment, vehicles and volunte€r personnel sufficient to fight
fires ifrat accur within its type and sphere of fire protection operation and
will compty with palicy considerqtiong defined and adopted by Randall
Courtty's governing authori$.

Atl tire calls received by the Fire Department trsm Randall Gounty shail be
promptly answefed, attended and fougfrt with the expected ekills of a
trained volunteer fire-fighting unit.

For any S11 call for fire or Emergency Medical $ervices tEM$) in the
Mllage of Palisades, the Randall County Sheriffs Ofiic* dispatch will page
the Fire Departrnent to raspond. lrnmediately afierward. Randall County
Fire will be paged to respond. tf the Village sf Palisades Fire Department
ie availabla and able to handle the request for service, they will nottfy
Randall County Fire ta disregard u*ing the comrnon response channel

{RCFD 1}. lf the Fire Department is unavailable or needs aesistancs with
the incidant, Randall County Fire willrespond.

The Fire Departrnent sgrses that each of its volunteer or f$ll-time
flrefighters shall have a rninimum of twen$ hours of fitufighter training per
year. Training may be either in-house or fsrmalized training at fire
schsols and shall maet the requirements set forth by the National Fira
Prctection Agency (NFPA 1001). Firefightors responding to Randall
County will hald ae a minimum a Firefighter I certification from the Texas
State Firemen's and Fire Marshal's Associatlcn or a basic structure
Cefiification from the Texas Commission on Fire PrOtection and, in

addition, shall have completed the National ![tildland Coordinating Group
S130 and $1S0 course$. Furthermora, the Fire Departrnent agree* that
each of its fiiEfighters responding to EMS (Emergency Medical $ervices)
incident* urill hold a cunent license with the Taxas Department ef $tate
Health $ervices at a minimum of the Ernergenc)/ Care Attendant levol snd
will operate undar the current medical protocols apprwed by the rnedical
director. These training requirements shall be documented for each
individuat on the $tat* Firemen's and Fira Marshal's website and an
annual prsgrs$s report shall be printed and submitted to the Rsndall
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County Auditor before the end of January each yesr" Failure to confirm
each membsr'e training may rasult in termination of this cantract.

The Fire Department shall be in compliance with the National Incident
Managernent System (NIMS). All firefighters must complete the following
classes: l$ 100, 200, 7CI0 and 800. All supervieors must complete the
above*rnentioned classes as well es lS 300. ln addition, Chief Sflicers
rnust cornpletre lE 400.

In consideration of fir"e proteclion sprvices, Randall Coun$ agrees to pay
the Fire Oepartment the sum of $5,000 annually, to b+ paid in equql
quarterly installrnents. ln addition, an allotment of 204a/o of this sum may
be paid to the Fire Separtment by the Randall Courty Assi*tance District
No. 1 il in the sole discretion of the Randall County Commissioners Court,
suffici*nt funds sre .colfected by the Assistanc€ Sistrict to pay this
allotment along with alt other obligations of the Assistance Oistrict All
montes received by the Fire Department shall be used for fire equipment
and services. Paymant may be withheld il any reports required by ttris
agreement are delinquent. Randall Cou*ty shall release withh*ld funds
upon receipt of all cunently due reBorts.

At the e*d sf each manth, the Firs Department shall fumish to Randall
Cour*y two copies of a compkte written report of every eall or run made
by any of its fire engines and crews to every fire, or notice that no fire rune
lvsre made during the monlh. One copy of such report shall be mailed or
emailed to the Randall County Judge and the other to the Randall County
Auditor. Every report shall inslude: the nalure of the {ire; victim's
name{s}; the location thereof; the type *f property involved; tha cause, if
knswR, of the fire; and the results of the efforts of the unit fighting said firo.
Payment of ary $um$ due shall be withheld until such catl or run
documentation has been properly repoiled.

Randall County shsll provide workers compensation ineurance far
volunteer firefighters who are in good standing with the Fire Department
$aid insurancs *hall cover each volunteer firefightsr whlle ifi n'on duty"
status with his re*pective unit white re*ponding to incldents occurrtng in
the unincorporated areas of Randall County. The Fira Departrnant shall
provide a list af its volunteers to the Randall County Auditor's Offise.

The.f,[a Sei$firtrnent agrees to be *n eque] opportunig employer and
shall not discriminate on the besis of race, religion, color, siax, a{te,
national origin, disability, veteran statu*, sexual orientation, or any other
status protected by federalor state law.
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10. Randall County reserves the right to revoke this contract at any time due
to lack of funding or for non-compliance with the terms outlined in this
contrac{.

11 Randall County re$erves the right ts conduct a complete audit of the Fire
Department.

1?. This agreement is made in compliance with the current statutes granting
Randall County authority to provide fire protection to its rural residents.

13 This Agreement shall be become efiective on Octobet 1, 2A23 and shall
expire on September 30, 2A24. This agreement may be terminated upon
sixty (60) days written notice and the consent of both parties.

Signed on the /A day of {L *-lunsor- 2023.

of Palisades

Signed on the Cle day of

Christy

Attest:

Judge

$usan B. Allen, County Clerk

'iltt-,k, l/"J-*-
Secretary, Village of Palisades
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